

IFB 21.0004 2021 - 2022 School Bus Parts												AWARDED VENDOR	DUAL AWARDS	AWARDED VENDOR
MANUFACTURER	MODEL #	DESCRIPTION	UOM	Unit Price	Provide Brand/Manufacturer	Comments/Variations from spec	Unit Price	Provide Brand/Manufacturer	Comments/Variations from spec	AWARDED VENDOR	DUAL AWARDS	AWARDED VENDOR		
1	All Brands are Acceptable		Absorbent Pads - 15 x 19, Heavyweight; 100 ct per box	box/100	\$ 0.29	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment						
2	Navistar or Equal	3578858C2	Absorber, SHK CMN	each	\$ 67.08	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment						
3	All Brands are Acceptable		Accessories, Snow Broom w/Scraper; Wood Handle; 36"	each	\$ 5.13	HiTech		A Parts Warehouse						
4	Barjan or Equal		Accessories, Tire Thumper	each	\$ 6.45			A Parts Warehouse						
5	All Brands are Acceptable	4625 1094 77X	Air Dryer, AD-IP Air Dryer	each	\$ 153.72	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment						
6	All Brands are Acceptable	931 Group9A-79	Air Dryer, AD-IP Air Dryer	each	\$ 165.00	REDIBILT		Superior Turbo & Injection						
7	Leece-Neville Only	4943PGH	Alternator	each	\$ 506.02			Jackson Truck						
8	Leece-Neville Only	4959PA	Alternator	each	\$ 399.03	Leece-Neville		WW Williams Midwest Inc						
9	Leece-Neville Only	4833LGH	Alternator	each	\$ 512.62	Leece-Neville		WW Williams Midwest Inc						
10	Leece-Neville Only	4887JB	Alternator	each	\$ 436.10	Leece-Neville		WW Williams Midwest Inc						
11	Delco Only	19020310 (22-SI)	Alternator	each	\$ 119.95	19020310 DELCO		Kirk's Automotive						
12	All Brands are Acceptable		Antifreeze - Green - 55 Gallon Drum	gallon drum	\$ 220.67	FLEETGUARD	CC8972FLG	Reefer Peterbilt						
13	All Brands are Acceptable		Antifreeze - Green - Gallon Container	gallon	\$ 4.92	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment						
14	All Brands are Acceptable		Antifreeze - Red - 55 Gallon Drum	gallon	\$ 325.46	FLEETGUARD	CC36076FLG	Reefer Peterbilt						
15	All Brands are Acceptable		Antifreeze - Red - Gallon Container	gallon	\$ 4.55	FLEETGUARD	CC8974FLG	Reefer Peterbilt						
16	All Brands are Acceptable		Batteries 1000 - 1200 CCA Group 31 Top Stud	each	\$69+core	* what is the core cost?	Rated 950, reads 1000+	WW Williams Midwest Inc						
17	All Brands are Acceptable		Batteries 1000 - 1200 CCA Group 8D	each	\$147.14 exchg	Exide		Midwest Transit Equipment						
18	All Brands are Acceptable		Batteries 1300 - 1450 CCA Group 8D	each	\$ 146.29	EXIDE	CORE CHARGE \$72.00 APPLIES	TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S	\$125+core	Deka/EastPenn/Detroit Diesel	1425cca	WW Williams Midwest Inc		
19	All Brands are Acceptable		Batteries 315700 REDI Power	each	\$ 83.68	DEKA		Jackson Truck						
20	All Brands are Acceptable		Batteries 800 CCA Group 24 Top Post	each	\$ 84.78	DEKA		Jackson Truck						
21	All Brands are Acceptable		Batteries GM 800 CCA Group 78 Side Post	each	\$80.44 exchg	Exide		Midwest Transit Equipment						
22	Gates or Equal	7470	Belt	each	\$ 7.55	TRP	15465BLT	Reefer Peterbilt						
23	Gates or Equal	7490	Belt	each	\$ 7.60	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment						
24	Gates or Equal	7495	Belt	each	\$ 8.97	TRP	15495BLT	Reefer Peterbilt						
25	Gates or Equal	7500	Belt	each	\$ 8.50	TRP	15500BLT	Reefer Peterbilt						
26	Gates or Equal	9341HD	Belt	each	\$ 7.69	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment						
27	Gates or Equal	9345HD	Belt	each	\$ 8.64	TRP	17343BLT	Reefer Peterbilt						
28	Gates or Equal	9375HD	Belt	each	\$ 9.70	TRP	17375BLT	Reefer Peterbilt						
29	IH or Equal	184245SC1	Belt	each	\$ 21.52	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment						
30	Gates or Equal	4080575	Belt	each	\$ 27.39	GATES		Jackson Truck						
31	Gates or Equal	4080580DF	Belt	each	\$ 27.92	GATES		Jackson Truck						
32	Gates or Equal	4080585DF	Belt	each	\$ 28.79	GATES		Jackson Truck						
33	Gates or Equal	4080590	Belt	each	\$ 31.96	GATES		Jackson Truck						
34	Gates or Equal	4080600	Belt	each	\$ 28.25	GATES		Jackson Truck						

35	Gates or Equal	4080615	Belt	each	\$ 28.44	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
36	Gates or Equal	4080630	Belt	each	\$ 28.66	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
37	Gates or Equal	4080685	Belt	each	\$ 30.11	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
38	Gates or Equal	4080690	Belt	each	\$ 30.97	GATES		Jackson Truck				
39	Gates or Equal	4080695DF	Belt	each	\$ 30.47	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
40	Gates or Equal	4080707	Belt	each	\$ 26.01	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
41	Gates or Equal	4080710DF	Belt	each	\$ 31.09	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
42	Gates or Equal	4080716	Belt	each	\$ 31.09	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
43	Gates or Equal	4080730DF	Belt	each	\$ 33.31	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
44	Gates or Equal	4080733	Belt	each	\$ 33.17	GATES		Jackson Truck				
45	Gates or Equal	4080779DF	Belt	each	NO BID							
46	Gates or Equal	660HD	Belt	each	\$ 14.03	2524489 NAPA-GATES		Kirk's Automotive				
47	Gates or Equal	9425HD	Belt	each	\$ 8.42	TRP	17425BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
48	Gates or Equal	9463HD	Belt	each	\$ 11.65	TRP	17465BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
49	Gates or Equal	9490HD	Belt	each	\$ 9.25	TRP	17490BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
50	Gates or Equal	9560HD	Belt	each	\$ 10.09	TRP	17560BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
51	Gates or Equal	9570HD	Belt	each	\$ 12.40	TRP	17570BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
52	Gates or Equal	9580HD	Belt	each	\$ 10.85	TRP	17580BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
53	Gates or Equal	9585HD	Belt	each	\$ 12.24	TRP	17585BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
54	Gates or Equal	9640HD	Belt	each	\$ 11.65	TRP	17640BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
55	Gates or Equal	9650HD	Belt	each	\$ 12.06	TRP	17650BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
56	Gates or Equal	9670HD	Belt	each	\$ 12.54	TRP	17670BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
57	Gates or Equal	9680HD	Belt	each	\$ 12.55	TRP	17680BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
58	Gates or Equal	9690HD	Belt	each	\$ 12.55	TRP	17690BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
59	Gates or Equal	9700HD	Belt	each	\$ 13.91	TRP	17700BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
60	Gates or Equal	9710HD	Belt	each	\$ 14.41	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
61	Gates or Equal	9720HD	Belt	each	\$ 14.38	TRP	17725BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
62	Gates or Equal	K060905	Belt	each	\$ 16.61	GATES		Jackson Truck				
63	Gates or Equal	K060945	Belt	each	\$ 15.62	TRP	645K6BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
64	Gates or Equal	K061015	Belt	each	\$ 19.56	GATES		Jackson Truck				
65	Gates or Equal	K061020	Belt	each	\$ 23.23	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
66	Gates or Equal	K061115	Belt	each	\$ 19.95	GATES		Jackson Truck				
67	Gates or Equal	K080726	Belt	each	\$ 32.33	TRP	720K8BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
68	Gates or Equal	K080797	Belt	each	\$ 17.35	TRP	795K8BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
69	Gates or Equal	K080830	Belt	each	\$ 25.56	TRP	830K8BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
70	Gates or Equal	K080839	Belt	each	\$ 25.97	TRP	839K8BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
71	Gates or Equal	K080839HD	Belt	each	\$ 25.97	TRP	839K8BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
72	Gates or Equal	K081000	Belt	each	\$ 24.33	GATES		Jackson Truck				
73	Gates or Equal	K081020	Belt	each	\$ 33.98	GATES		Jackson Truck				
74	Gates or Equal	K081124	Belt	each	\$ 28.78	TRP	1124K8BLT	Reefer Peterbilt				
75	Gates or Equal	K081189	Belt	each	\$ 27.07	GATES		Jackson Truck				
76	Alliant Power or Equal	5100720	Belt, Serpentine	each	\$ 39.01	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
77	Navistar or Equal	1817958C1	Bolt	each	\$ 3.13	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
78	Navistar or Equal	1840773C2	Bolt	each	\$ 21.16	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
79	Navistar or Equal	40231R1	Bolt	each	\$ 4.34	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
80	Groco or Equal	CP-BBC	Booster Pump	each	\$ 171.00			A Parts Warehouse				
81	ACI or Equal	1798420	Box, Latch	each	NO BID							
82	International or Equal	2216058C1	Box, Latch	each	\$ 8.37	Southco		A Parts Warehouse	\$ 20.87	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment
83	Bendix or Equal	275491	Brake Air Governor	each	\$ 14.55	H284358 NAPA		Kirk's Automotive				
84	Bendix or Equal	55250	Brake Calipers	each	\$ 54.99	97-17247D BBB		Kirk's Automotive				
85	Bendix or Equal	5585ZOH	Brake Calipers	each	\$ 78.89	Meritor		Midwest Transit Equipment				
86	Bendix Welded or Equal	3230951	Brake Chambers 3" Welded	each	\$ 45.10	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
87	MGM Welded or Equal	3230951	Brake Chambers 3" Welded	each	\$ 45.10	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
88	Bendix or Equal		Brake Chambers 30/30 Complete	each	\$ 43.09	BENDIX		Jackson Truck				
89	Haldex or Equal	LP3030LK	Brake Chambers 30/30 Piggy Back	each	\$ 40.56	BENDIX		Jackson Truck				

90	Bendix or Equal		Brake Chambers 30/30 Piggy Back, Long Stroke	each	\$ 42.52	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
91	MGM or Equal		Brake Chambers 30/30 Piggy Back, Short Stroke 2.5"	each	\$ 40.56	BENDIX		Jackson Truck			
92	MGM or Equal		Brake Chambers 30/30, Complete, Short Stroke 2.5"	each	\$ 38.50	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
93	Bendix or Equal		Brake Chambers T-24 Diaphragm	each	\$ 2.26	BENDIX		Jackson Truck			
94	MGM or Equal		Brake Chambers T-24 Diaphragm	each	\$ 2.26	BENDIX		Jackson Truck			
95	Bendix or Equal		Brake Chambers T-30 Diaphragm	each	\$ 2.26	BENDIX		Jackson Truck			
96	MGM or Equal		Brake Chambers T-30 Diaphragm	each	\$ 2.26	BENDIX		Jackson Truck			
97	Bendix, MGM, Haldex, Midland or Equal	T24	Brake Chambers, Front Chambers, Complete Chamber, T24	each	\$ 15.58	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
98	Bendix, MGM, Haldex, Midland or Equal	T30	Brake Chambers, Front Chambers, Complete Chamber, T30	each	\$ 19.80	SIRCO		Jackson Truck			
99	All Brands are Acceptable		Brake Cleaner, Chlorinated	case	\$ 39.00	091314 CRC		Kirk's Automotive			
100	All Brands are Acceptable		Brake Cleaner, Non-Chlorinated	case	\$2.15/25.80	CYCLO		Jackson Truck			
101	Gunite or Equal	3295A	Brake Drums	each	\$ 153.07	GUNITE		WW Williams Midwest Inc			
102	Gunite or Equal	3295AX	Brake Drums	each	\$ 162.14	GUNITE		WW Williams Midwest Inc			
103	Gunite or Equal	3600AX	Brake Drums	each	\$ 79.00	MERITOR		Jackson Truck			
104	Gunite or Equal	3687X	Brake Drums	each	\$ 90.16	GUNITE		WW Williams Midwest Inc			
105	Gunite or Equal	3710X	Brake Drums	each	\$ 128.00	WEBB	DB1655B	Reefer Peterbilt			
106	Gunite or Equal	3721X	Brake Drums	each	\$ 96.85	MERITOR		Jackson Truck			
107	Gunite or Equal	3757X	Brake Drums	each	\$ 139.95	GUNITE		Jackson Truck			
108	Gunite or Equal	3786X	Brake Drums	each	\$ 153.54	GUNITE		Jackson Truck			
109	Gunite or Equal	3800X	Brake Drums	each	\$ 83.06	GUNITE		WW Williams Midwest Inc			
110	Gunite or Equal	3600A	Brake Drums	each	\$ 77.90	WEBB	DB1657U	Reefer Peterbilt			
111	Bendix or Equal	MKD786	Brake Pad	each	\$ 75.13	FLEETRITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S			
112	Bendix or Equal	ZICMK225PREM	Brake Pad	each	\$ 74.20	Frasle		Midwest Transit Equipment			
113	Bendix or Equal	BXMKD786	Brake Pads / Full Kit	each	\$ 75.13	FLEETRITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S			
114	IH or Equal	594596C1	Brake Rotors	each	\$ 107.30	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
115	Abex or Equal	EL4702QSBK4D	Brake Shoes Kit - New Only	each	\$ 48.24	FLEETRITE	CORE CHARGE \$36.00 APPLIES	TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S			
116	Abex or Equal	EL4703QSBK4D	Brake Shoes Kit - New Only	each	\$ 54.96	MERITOR		Jackson Truck			
117	Abex or Equal	L4707QSBK4D	Brake Shoes Kit - New Only	each	\$ 41.95	MERITOR		Jackson Truck			
118	Meritor or Equal	XK2124702QP	Brake Shoes Kit - New Only	each	\$ 27.50	FLEETRITE	CORE CHARGE \$48.00 APPLIES	TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S			
119	Meritor or Equal	XK2124703QP	Brake Shoes Kit - New Only	each	\$ 54.96	MERITOR		Jackson Truck			
120	Meritor or Equal	XK2124707QP	Brake Shoes Kit - New Only	each	\$ 41.95	MERITOR		Jackson Truck			
121	Abex or Equal	XK2124709E2	Brake Shoes Kit - New Only	each	\$ 45.90	FLEETRITE	CORE CHARGE \$34.00 APPLIES	TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S			
122	Bendix or Equal	229860	Brake Valve	each	\$ 8.00	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
123	Bendix or Equal	278614	Brake Valve	each	\$ 21.18	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
124	Bendix or Equal	284142	Brake Valve	each	\$ 2.87	Navistar	FLTBV4142N Valve	Midwest Transit Equipment			

125	Bendix or Equal	284412	Brake Valve	each	\$ 106.30	KN24001 HALDEX		Kirk's Automotive				
126	Bendix or Equal	5005037	Brake Valve	each	\$ 2.87	Navistar	FLTBV4142N Valve	Midwest Transit Equipment				
127	Bendix or Equal	65661	Brake Valve	each	\$ 129.17	BENDIX		Jackson Truck				
128	Bendix or Equal	800142	Brake Valve	each	\$ 94.17	bendix		WW Williams Midwest Inc				
129	Haldux or Equal	KN20031	Brake Valve	each	\$ 25.11	HALDEX		Jackson Truck				
130	Haldux or Equal	KN31000	Brake Valve	each	\$ 22.17	Meritor		WW Williams Midwest Inc				
131	Haldux or Equal	KN31011	Brake Valve	each	\$ 22.17	Meritor		WW Williams Midwest Inc				
132	Haldux or Equal	KN32005	Brake Valve	each	\$ 10.24	HALDEX		Jackson Truck				
133	Navistar or Equal	3613449C1	Bumper	each	\$ 889.41	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
134	International Navistar or Equal	1698113C1	Bushing, Spring	each	\$ 4.20	DAYTON		Jackson Truck				
135	Navistar or Equal	2588037C1	Cap, W/S Tank 6 Q	each	\$ 4.21	Wexco		A Parts Warehouse				
136	International or Equal	2588037C1	Cap, Windshield Washer Bottle	each	\$ 4.21	Wexco		A Parts Warehouse				
137	All Brands are Acceptable		Caulk, Silicone - Black	each	\$ 3.85	Adaseal		A Parts Warehouse				
138	All Brands are Acceptable		Caulk, Silicone - Clear	each	\$ 3.85	Adaseal		A Parts Warehouse				
139	All Brands are Acceptable		Caulk, Silicone - Red Hi-Temp	each	\$ 5.52	Adaseal		A Parts Warehouse				
140	All Brands are Acceptable		Caulk, Silicone - Yellow	each	\$ 4.96	CSL Silicone		Unity School Bus Parts				
141	Cummins	2880482	Clamp	each	\$ 21.58			A Parts Warehouse				
142	All Brands are Acceptable		Clamp, "U" Type Exhaust 3# Stainless Steel	each	\$ 2.45	Flexatube		A Parts Warehouse				
143	All Brands are Acceptable		Clamp, "U" Type Exhaust 3.5# Stainless Steel	each	\$ 2.50	Flexatube		A Parts Warehouse				
144	All Brands are Acceptable		Clamp, "U" Type Exhaust 4# Stainless Steel	each	\$ 3.34	DONALDSON		Jackson Truck				
145	Cummins	3896337	Clamp, "U" Band	each	\$ 21.58			A Parts Warehouse				
146	All Brands are Acceptable		Clamps, Band Preformed Stainless Steel 3"	each	\$ 7.78	DONALDSON		Jackson Truck				
147	All Brands are Acceptable		Clamps, Band Preformed Stainless Steel 3.5"	each	\$ 8.13	DONALDSON		Jackson Truck				
148	All Brands are Acceptable		Clamps, Band Preformed Stainless Steel 4"	each	\$ 8.07	DONALDSON		Jackson Truck				
149	All Brands are Acceptable		Clamps, Flat Band, Easy Seal Stainless Steel 3"	each	\$ 7.35	RIKER		Jackson Truck				
150	All Brands are Acceptable		Clamps, Flat Band, Easy Seal Stainless Steel 3.5"	each	\$ 7.50			A Parts Warehouse				
151	All Brands are Acceptable		Clamps, Flat Band, Easy Seal Stainless Steel 4"	each	\$ 7.08	RIKER		Jackson Truck				
152	Diesel Force		Cleaner, EGR System Cleaner		\$ 12.16	HOWES DIESEL TREAT	103060	Reefer Peterbilt				
153	Cummins	3928865	Clutch Fan	each	\$ 824.19	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck				
154	Navistar or Equal- incorrect P/N released	362802C1	Cmember	each	\$ 519.60	Navistar	3628202C1	Midwest Transit Equipment				
155			Compressor, '1 Cyl Air Compressor for Cummins		NO BID							
156	Cummins	80001570	Connector, Female	each	\$ 20.49	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck				
157	Cummins	2880305	Connector, Male	each	\$ 18.74	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck				
158	International or Equal	4307362R91	Cooler EGR (Exhaust Gas Recirculation)	each	\$ 632.13	Dorman		Unity School Bus Parts				
159	Braun or Equal	33094A	Cylinder, Roll Stop Assembly	each	\$ 320.00	Braun		Midwest Transit Equipment				
160	Freightliner or Equal	04-17925-004	Exhaust Pipes	each	\$ 108.00	MTR	F113-77	A Parts Warehouse				
161	Freightliner or Equal	04-18363-001	Exhaust Pipes	each	\$ 215.00	MTR	SB8-3034FL-2	A Parts Warehouse				

162	Freightliner or Equal	04-20378-034	Exhaust Pipes	each	\$ 241.32	Nelson		Midwest Transit Equipment				
163	Freightliner or Equal	04-21455-102	Exhaust Pipes	each	\$ 235.63	Nelson		Midwest Transit Equipment				
164	Freightliner or Equal	04-22434-000	Exhaust Pipes	each	\$ 197.00	MTR	F1142-2	A Parts Warehouse				
165	Freightliner or Equal	04-22438-004	Exhaust Pipes	each	\$ 108.00	MTR	F113-77	A Parts Warehouse				
166	Freightliner or Equal	04-22451-000	Exhaust Pipes	each	\$ 126.00	MTR	F141-4	A Parts Warehouse				
167	Freightliner or Equal	A04-18556-000	Exhaust Pipes	each	\$ 112.00	MTR	F1311	A Parts Warehouse				
168	IH or Equal	WX47766	Exhaust, Over Axle	each	\$ 208.00	MTR	I1342	A Parts Warehouse				
169	IH or Equal	WX49238	Exhaust, Tail Pipe	each	\$ 176.80	49238 WALKER		Kirk's Automotive				
170	IH or Equal	3582606C2	Exhaust, Turbo Pipe	each	\$ 187.82	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
171	Fleetgard or Equal	AF25707	Filter, Air	each	\$ 32.03	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
172	Fleetgard or Equal	AF26154	Filter, Air	each	\$ 33.48	FLEETGUARD	AF26154FLG	Reefer Peterbilt				
173	Fleetgard or Equal	AF4911	Filter, Air	each	\$ 22.39	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
174	Fleetgard or Equal	AF979M	Filter, Air	each	\$ 24.77	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
175	Fleetgard or Equal	AH1193	Filter, Air	each	\$ 47.77	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
176	Bendix or Equal	107794	Filter, Air Dryer	each	\$ 19.86	BENDIX		Jackson Truck				
177	Meritor or Equal	R950011	Filter, Air Dryer	each	\$ 17.99	MERITOR		Jackson Truck				
178	Cummins	2871462	Filter, DPF Module Filter	each	\$ 1,688.03	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck				
179	International or Equal	1966993	Filter, Fuel	each	\$ 14.45	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
180	Fleetgard or Equal	FF5269	Filter, Fuel	each	\$ 6.02	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
181	Fleetgard or Equal	FF5380	Filter, Fuel	each	\$ 9.06	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
182	Fleetgard or Equal	FF5632	Filter, Fuel	each	\$ 9.44	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
183	Freightliner or Equal	N83 328214	Filter, Heater	each	\$ 9.17	Bergstrom		Unity School Bus Parts				
184	Freightliner or Equal	N83 328473	Filter, Heater	each	\$ 3.56	Bergstrom		Unity School Bus Parts				
185	Fleetgard or Equal	HF35296	Filter, Hydraulic	each	\$ 8.91	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
186	Fleetgard or Equal	HF35476	Filter, Hydraulic	each	\$ 10.05	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
187	Fleetgard or Equal	HF6056	Filter, Hydraulic	each	\$ 3.62	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
188	Fleetgard or Equal	LF16166	Filter, Lube	each	\$ 9.93	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
189	Fleetgard or Equal	LF3342	Filter, Oil	each	\$ 3.01	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
190	Fleetgard or Equal	LF3883	Filter, Oil	each	\$ 12.92	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
191	Fleetgard or Equal	LF3914	Filter, Oil	each	\$ 8.08	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
192	Fleetgard or Equal	LF3970	Filter, Oil	each	\$ 5.76	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
193	Fleetgard or Equal	LF667	Filter, Oil	each	\$ 5.19	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
194	Fleetgard or Equal	LF9025	Filter, Oil	each	\$ 22.44	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
195	Fleetgard or Equal	HF6162	Filter, Power Steering	each	\$ 4.38	FLEETGUARD	HF6162FLG	Reefer Peterbilt				
196	Fleetgard or Equal	HF28943	Filter, Transmission	each	\$ 39.04	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
197	Fleetgard or Equal	WF2051	Filter, Water	each	\$ 5.93	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
198	Fleetgard or Equal	WF2077	Filter, Water	each	\$ 4.77	Fleetguard		Reefer Peterbilt				
199	Fleetgard or Equal	WF2101	Filter, Water	each	\$ 4.96	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
200	Fleetgard or Equal	WF2106	Filter, Water	each	\$ 10.75	Fleetguard		Reefer Peterbilt				
201			Diesel Exhaust Fluid (DEF)		\$ 8.53	SHELL		Jackson Truck				
202	Fleetgard or Equal	FK48000	Fuel, Filter	each	\$ 56.31	FLEETGUARD	FK48000FLG	Reefer Peterbilt				
203	Fleetgard or Equal	FS19947	Fuel, Filter	each	\$ 31.11	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
204	International or Equal	1878042C91	Fuel, Filter	each	\$ 33.54	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
205	International or Equal	3533425C3	Fuel Line (Fitting at Filter Head)	each	\$ 21.34	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
206	International or Equal	3591094C1	Fuel Line (Fitting at Filter Head)	each	\$ 10.43	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
207	International or Equal	3533426C3	Fuel Line (Fitting at Filter Head)	each	\$ 25.24	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
208	Diesel Force		Ultimate 11 Fuel Treatment		NO BID							
209	Fleetgard or Equal	FS1287	Fuel/Water Separator	each	\$ 17.09	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
210	Fleetgard or Equal	FS19521	Fuel/Water Separator	each	\$ 14.76	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				
211	Fleetgard or Equal	FS19547	Fuel/Water Separator	each	\$ 15.84	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
212	Fleetgard or Equal	FS19684E	Fuel/Water Separator	each	\$ 8.19	FLEETGUARD	FS19684EFLG	Reefer Peterbilt				
213	Fleetgard or Equal	FS19798	Fuel/Water Separator	each	\$ 16.44	BALDWIN		Jackson Truck				

214	Fleetgard or Equal	FS19855	Fuel/Water Separator	each	\$ 8.17	Fleetguard	Midwest Transit Equipment				
215	Cummins	2866337	Gasket	each	\$ 5.70	CUMMINS	Jackson Truck				
216	Cummins	2871451	Gasket	each	\$ 18.17	CUMMINS	Jackson Truck				
217	Cummins	2880214	Gasket	each	\$ 7.69	CUMMINS	Jackson Truck				
218	Cummins	4337596	Gasket	each	\$ 26.40	CUMMINS	Jackson Truck				
219	Cummins	5272448	Gasket	each	\$ 5.68	CUMMINS	Jackson Truck				
220	Cummins	2866636	Gasket	each	\$ 5.79	CUMMINS	Jackson Truck				
221	Navistar or Equal	2593998C1	Gasket, 3B	each	\$ 6.95	2593998C1 INTERSTATE	Kirk's Automotive				
222	Navistar or Equal	1836542C1	Gasket, Int	each	\$ 26.92	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
223	Navistar or Equal	2593986C1	Gasket, Off	each	\$ 6.95	2593986C1 INTERSTATE	Kirk's Automotive				
224	Navistar or Equal	464751C3	Gasket, Plug Expansion	each	\$ 11.02	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
225	Navistar or Equal	1833007C1	Gasket, Tur	each	\$ 19.31	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
226	Navistar or Equal	497840C96	Gauge	each	\$ 80.19	2239003 DORMAN	Kirk's Automotive				
227	Navistar or Equal	3864394C92	Gauge, Fuel	each	\$ 112.71	77652651 DORMAN	Kirk's Automotive				
228	All Brands are Acceptable		Gloves - Nitrile (Power Free)	box/100	\$ 12.00	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
229	All Brands are Acceptable		Gloves - Vinyl (Latex Free)	box/100	\$ 7.60	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
230	Phillips 66		Grease, Multi Plex Red #2	55 gal	\$ 3.67	Shell	Midwest Transit Equipment				
231	Navistar or Equal	1831196C92	Heater, Fuel Package		\$ 29.57	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
232	Bergstrom or Equal	530277	Heater/Defrost Motor	each	\$ 55.28	Bergstrom	Midwest Transit Equipment				
233	Navistar or Equal	3551734C2	Hood Cable	each	\$ 28.50	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
234	Navistar or Equal	3566561C1	Hood Spacer	each	\$ 17.78	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
235	International or Equal	5120021	Horn, Combo	each	\$ 12.12		A Parts Warehouse				
236	International or Equal	4022021	Horn, High Note	each	\$ 6.68	Fiamm	Unity School Bus Parts				
237	International or Equal	4022121	Horn, Low Note	each	\$ 6.68	Fiamm	Unity School Bus Parts				
238	Navistar or Equal	5010598R92	IDM, Remanufactured	each	\$ 804.42	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
239	All Brands are Acceptable	AP60901	Injector	each	\$ 164.72	REDIBILT	Superior Turbo & Injection				
240	Cummins	2871878	Injector, Doser Injector	each	\$ 205.00	BOSCH 0444043008	Kirk's Automotive				
241	Cummins		Injector, Doser Injector	each	NO BID						
242	Navistar or Equal	1846481C92	Int Man A	each	\$ 55.86	Dorman	Unity School Bus Parts				
243	Navistar or Equal	1847129C94	Kit	each	\$ 200.59	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
244	Navistar or Equal	1881150C92	Kit	each	\$ 702.37	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
245	Navistar or Equal	1882993C94	Kit	each	\$ 174.64	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
246	Navistar or Equal	1847085C93	Kit Seal	each	\$ 108.17	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
247	International or Equal	393442C1	Lamps, Switch	each	\$ 23.60	Dorman	Unity School Bus Parts				
248	All Brands are Acceptable	1003	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.20	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
249	All Brands are Acceptable	1004	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.20	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
250	All Brands are Acceptable	1141	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.20	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
251	All Brands are Acceptable	1156	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.20	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
252	All Brands are Acceptable	1156DC	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.20	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
253	All Brands are Acceptable	1157	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.17	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment	\$ 0.17	FLEETRITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S
254	All Brands are Acceptable	1893	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.17	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment	\$ 0.17	FLEETRITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S
255	All Brands are Acceptable	1895	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.16	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment	\$ 0.16	FLEETRITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S
256	All Brands are Acceptable	194	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.16	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment	\$ 0.16	FLEETRITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S

257	All Brands are Acceptable	198	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.23	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment					
258	All Brands are Acceptable	211-2	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.57	GE		Jackson Truck					
259	All Brands are Acceptable	37	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.25	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment					
260	All Brands are Acceptable	74	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.20	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment					
261	All Brands are Acceptable	90	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.19	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment					
262	All Brands are Acceptable	904	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.26	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment	\$ 0.26	FLEETRITE			TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S
263	All Brands are Acceptable	912	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.26	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment	\$ 0.26	FLEETRITE			TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S
264	All Brands are Acceptable	97	Light Bulbs	each	\$ 0.20	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment					
265	Grote or Equal	62011	Light, Back-Up Assembly	each	\$ 7.63	GROTE		Jackson Truck					
266	All Brands are Acceptable	OEM 6015	Light, Head	each	\$ 4.74	GE		Jackson Truck					
267	All Brands are Acceptable	OEM 6016	Light, Head	each	\$ 4.74	GE		Jackson Truck					
268	All Brands are Acceptable	OEM 9005	Light, Head	each	\$ 1.94	FLEETRITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S					
269	All Brands are Acceptable	OEM 9005XS	Light, Head	each	\$ 2.33	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment					
270	All Brands are Acceptable	OEM 9006XS	Light, Head	each	\$ 3.88	Wagner		Unity School Bus Parts					
271	All Brands are Acceptable	OEM 9008	Light, Head	each	\$ 7.09	Wagner		Unity School Bus Parts					
272	All Brands are Acceptable	OEM H4652	Light, Head	each	\$ 5.68	GE		Jackson Truck					
273	Sound Off or Equal	ECVML153R	Light, Marker	each	\$ 5.27	VINTAGE PARTS (VPI)	ECVML153R	Reefer Peterbilt					
274	Sound Off or Equal	ECVMLDP1R	Light, Marker	each	\$ 6.30	SOUND OFF		Jackson Truck					
275	Sound Off or Equal	ECVMLDP1Y	Light, Marker	each	\$ 6.30	SOUND OFF		Jackson Truck					
276	Truck Lite or Equal	35200R	Light, Marker	each	\$ 5.29	TRUCKLITE		Jackson Truck					
277	Truck Lite or Equal	35200Y	Light, Marker	each	\$ 5.29	TRUCKLITE		Jackson Truck					
278	Weldon or Equal	5000	Light, Marker	each	\$ 5.62	Weldon		Midwest Transit Equipment					
279	Weldon or Equal	5001-2	Light, Marker	each	\$ 2.96	Weldon		Unity School Bus Parts					
280	Weldon or Equal	5002	Light, Marker	each	\$ 2.96	Weldon		Unity School Bus Parts					
281	Weldon or Equal	5050-1400-10	Light, Marker	each	\$ 3.20			A Parts Warehouse					
282	Sound Off or Equal	ECVML153A	Light, Marker	each	\$ 5.43	OPTI LUX		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S					
283	Weldon or Equal	5050-1400-20	Light, Marker Amber	each	\$ 3.20			A Parts Warehouse					
284	Baader Brown or Equal	2000A	Light, Overhead	each	\$ 74.62	TRUCK LITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S					
285	Baader Brown or Equal	2000R	Light, Overhead	each	\$ 72.36	TRUCK LITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S					
286	Weldon or Equal	1020	Light, Overhead 8-Way	each	\$ 47.75	Weldon		Unity School Bus Parts					
287	All Brands are Acceptable	4636	Light, Overhead Bulb	each	\$ 8.68	Wagner		Unity School Bus Parts					
288	All Brands are Acceptable	H3	Light, Overhead Bulb	each	\$ 2.78	GE		Midwest Transit Equipment					
289	Arrow or Equal	035-00-132	Light, Step	each	\$ 9.52	Weldon		Midwest Transit Equipment					
290	Weldon or Equal	3-1060-1100	Light, Step	each	\$ 8.24	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment					
291	Weldon or Equal	8025-1400-30	Light, Step	each	\$ 5.14	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment					
292	Weldon or Equal	8025-9100-30	Light, Step	each	\$ 4.94	Weldon		Midwest Transit Equipment					
293	Specialty or Equal	189	Light, Stop Arm Bulb Socket	each	\$ 8.03	Specialty		Midwest Transit Equipment					
294	Specialty or Equal	194K	Light, Stop Arm Lens Kit	each	\$ 6.60	Specialty		Midwest Transit Equipment					
295	SMC or Equal	5500M	Light, Stop Arm Light Assembly, Complete	each	\$ 215.35	Specialty		Midwest Transit Equipment					
296	Grote or Equal	50852	Light, Stop/Tail	each	\$ 4.21	GROTE		Jackson Truck					

297	Grote or Equal	50882-1	Light, Stop/Tail	each	\$ 3.81	GROTE		Jackson Truck				
298	Grote or Equal	GR52772	Light, Stop/Tail	each	\$ 2.22	TRP	LB010402	Reefer Peterbilt				
299	Sound Off or Equal	7561STT	Light, Stop/Tail	each	\$ 23.82	OPTI LUX		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
300	Sound Off or Equal	7561TY	Light, Stop/Tail	each	\$ 23.82	OPTI LUX		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
301	Sound Off or Equal	ECVR42STT	Light, Stop/Tail	each	\$ 11.04	OPTI LUX		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
302	All Brands are Acceptable		Light, Strobe 4" Self Contained Clean	each	\$ 67.30			A Parts Warehouse				
303	Navistar or Equal	596590C1	Linin 1'	each	\$ 6.98	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
304	International or Equal	3534115C91	Link, Steering Drag	each	\$ 140.08	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
305	Fleetgard or Equal	LF9025	Lubefilt	each	\$ 22.44	Fleetguard		Midwest Transit Equipment				
306	Mirror Lite or Equal		Mirror, Double Nickel Flat Assembly - Heated	each	\$ 59.43			A Parts Warehouse	\$ 59.43	Rosco		Unity School Bus Parts
307	Mirror Lite or Equal		Mirror, Double Nickel Convex Assembly - Heated	each	\$ 61.41			A Parts Warehouse	\$ 61.42	Rosco		Unity School Bus Parts
308	Mirror Lite or Equal		Mirror, Double Nickel Convex Assembly - Unheated	each	\$ 36.57			A Parts Warehouse				
309	Mirror Lite or Equal		Mirror, Double Nickel Flat Assembly - Unheated	each	\$ 35.80	Mirror Lite		Midwest Transit Equipment				
310	Mirror Lite or Equal	74-4-63	Mirror, Double Nickel Heating Element - No Wires	each	\$ 8.82	ROSCOE	74-4-63RSC	Reefer Peterbilt				
311	Rosco or Equal	143-50 LH	Mirror, Rosco	each	\$ 30.63	NAVISTAR		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
312	Rosco or Equal	145-50 RH	Mirror, Rosco	each	\$ 36.30	NAVISTAR		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
313	Rosco or Equal	3360H	Mirror, Rosco	each	\$ 45.66	Rosco		Midwest Transit Equipment				
314	Cummins	2871571	Module, Catalyst	each	\$ 950.33	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck				
315	Cummins	5283311	Module, Doser	each	\$ 416.19	CUMMINS	5283311RXCUM	Reefer Peterbilt				
316	Kysor or Equal	7514	Motor, Door Ent	each	\$ 185.18	NAVISTAR		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
317	Donaldson or Equal	DN MFM 110594	Muffler	each	\$ 248.75			A Parts Warehouse				
318	Donaldson or Equal	DN MFM 110728	Muffler	each	\$ 212.24			A Parts Warehouse				
319	Freightliner or Equal	04-19936-001	Muffler	each	\$ 193.32			A Parts Warehouse				
320	Walker or Equal	WX 22551	Muffler	each	\$ 78.75	FLEETRITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
321	Autojet or Equal	C0025	Muffler	each	\$ 125.00			A Parts Warehouse				
322	Freightliner or Equal	A04-17998-001	Muffler Hanger	each	\$ 49.29	FREIGHTLINER		Hoekstra				
323	Freightliner or Equal	A04-20919-000	Muffler Hanger	each	\$ 34.00	MTR	22LFMH-2	A Parts Warehouse				
324	Freightliner or Equal	A04-21559-000	Muffler Hanger	each	\$ 49.05	FREIGHTLINER		Hoekstra				
325	All Brands are Acceptable	124925	Nut	each	\$ 1.36	NAVISTAR		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
326	Kendall		Oil, SHP Diesel Full Synthetic 5W40	400 lbs	NO BID							
327	Cummins	3958209	Oil Pan	each	\$ 276.80	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck				
328	International or Equal	1876974C91	Oil Pan, DT 466 Max Force	each	\$ 419.95	DORMAN		Jackson Truck				
329	International or Equal	1823740C93	Oil Pan, DT 466E	each	\$ 419.95	DORMAN		Jackson Truck				
330	3M or Equal	7446	Pads, Hand Scotch Bright, 6 x 9 Gray	each	NO BID							
331	3M or Equal	7447	Pads, Hand Scotch Bright, 6 x 9 Maroon	each	\$ 1.60	NAVISTAR		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
332	All Brands are Acceptable		Paint, Spray, Black 16 oz can	each	\$ 6.57	BARNES		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				



333	All Brands are Acceptable		Penetrating Oil 16 oz can	case	\$ 3.49	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
334	International or Equal	3511254C1	Pin, Spring	each	\$ 25.33	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
335	Bergstrom or Equal	7259	Pump, Booster	each	\$ 88.93	Bergstrom	Midwest Transit Equipment				
336	Groco or Equal	200-0006-12	Pump, Booster	each	\$ 123.59	Groco	Midwest Transit Equipment				
337	Cummins	4387304	Pump, Doser Pump	each	\$ 675.00	0444042132 BOSCH	Kirk's Automotive				
338	Alliant or Equal	AP63682	Pump, Oil High Pressure	each	\$ 1,523.24		Superior Turbo & Injection				
339	International or Equal	1883888C93	Pump, Oil High Pressure	each	\$ 1,167.74	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
340	Navistar or Equal	3878032C1	Rear Door Panel	each	\$ 853.26	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
341	Navistar or Equal	1840903C91	Relay	each	\$ 57.13	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
342	Navistar or Equal	1820878C2	Ring	each	\$ 1.55	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
343	Navistar or Equal	1820878C1	Ring	each	\$ 1.55	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
344	Navistar or Equal	1873916C2	Rod	each	\$ 19.52	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
345	Eaton or Equal	ETN0815326	Rod	each	\$ 199.26	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
346	Braun Lift or Equal	9150312NA33Y	Roll Stop	each	\$ 156.60	Braun	Midwest Transit Equipment				
347	All Brands are Acceptable		Rubberized Coating, 16 oz	case	NO BID						
348	Navistar or Equal	1839026C1	Seal	each	\$ 6.35	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
349	National or Equal	370001A	Seal	each	\$ 22.88	NATIONAL	Jackson Truck				
350	National or Equal	370011A	Seal	each	\$ 26.91	NATIONAL	Jackson Truck				
351	National or Equal	370023A	Seal	each	\$ 29.83	NATIONAL	Jackson Truck				
352	National or Equal	370024A	Seal	each	\$ 30.04	NATIONAL	Jackson Truck				
353	National or Equal	370132A	Seal	each	\$ 23.42	NATIONAL	Jackson Truck				
354	National or Equal	370150A	Seal	each	\$ 20.40	NATIONAL	Jackson Truck				
355	National or Equal	380001A	Seal	each	\$ 28.18	NATIONAL	Jackson Truck				
356	National or Equal	V370001A	Seal	each	\$ 22.88	NATIONAL	Jackson Truck				
357	National or Equal	V380023A	Seal	each	\$ 34.20	380023A NATIONAL	Kirk's Automotive				
358	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, Bluebird 39" Fire Retardant Velcro 42 oz Min.	each	\$ 19.79		A Parts Warehouse				
359	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, Bluebird 39" Staple 42 oz Min.	each	\$ 16.89	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
360	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, Bluebird 39" Velcro 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 21.89	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
361	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, CE White	each	NO BID						
362	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, International 39" Fire Retardant Velcro 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 21.89	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
363	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, International 39" Fire Retardant Velcro 42 oz. Min. Seat Belt Ready	each	\$ 26.90	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
364	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, International 39" Staple 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 16.89	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
365	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, International 39" Velcro 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 21.89	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
366	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, Thomas 39" Fire Retardant Stapled 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 16.89	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
367	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, Thomas 39" Fire Retardant Velcro 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 21.89	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				

368	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, Thomas 39" Staple 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 16.89	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
369	BESI or Equal		Seat Backs, Thomas 39" Velcro 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 21.89	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
370	BESI or Equal		Seat Bottoms, Bluebird 39" Fire Retardant Staple 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 7.97	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
371	BESI or Equal		Seat Bottoms, Bluebird 39" Staple 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 7.57	BESI	Midwest Transit Equipment				
372	BESI or Equal		Seat Bottoms, International 39" Fire Retardant Staple 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 7.97	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
373	BESI or Equal		Seat Bottoms, International 39" Staple 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 7.57	BESI	Midwest Transit Equipment				
374	BESI or Equal		Seat Bottoms, Thomas 39" Fire Retardant Staple 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 7.97	BESI	Unity School Bus Parts				
375	BESI or Equal		Seat Bottoms, Thomas 39" Staple 42 oz. Min.	each	\$ 7.57	BESI	Midwest Transit Equipment				
376	BESI or Equal		Seat Cushion Bottom, Bluebird 39"	each	\$ 21.34	BESI	Midwest Transit Equipment				
377	BESI or Equal		Seat Cushion Bottom, International 39"	each	\$ 17.81	Triad	Midwest Transit Equipment				
378	BESI or Equal		Seat Cushion Bottom, Thomas 39"	each	\$ 21.34	Triad	Midwest Transit Equipment				
379	Triad or Equal		Seat Foam Back, Bluebird 39"	each	\$ 31.30	Triad	Midwest Transit Equipment				
380	Triad or Equal		Seat Foam Back, International 39"	each	\$ 27.77	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
381	Triad or Equal		Seat Foam Back, Thomas 39"	each	\$ 31.95	HSM	Unity School Bus Parts				
382	Uticolor or Equal		Seat Repair Spray Paint All Colors	each	\$ 11.50	WORLDWIDE	Midwest Transit Equipment				
383	Uticolor or Equal	UK-406	Seat Repair Vinyl Weld Compound	each	\$ 21.25	WORLDWIDE	Midwest Transit Equipment				
384	Shurtape or Equal		Seat Tape Blue	each	\$ 25.95	Berry Plastics	Unity School Bus Parts				
385	Shurtape or Equal		Seat Tape Brown	each	\$ 25.95	Berry Plastics	Unity School Bus Parts				
386	Shurtape or Equal		Seat Tape Gray	each	\$ 25.95	Berry Plastics	Unity School Bus Parts				
387	Shurtape or Equal		Seat Tape Green	each	\$ 25.95	Berry Plastics	Unity School Bus Parts				
388	Cummins	2872468	Sensor	each	\$ 16.20	Dorman	Unity School Bus Parts				
389	Navistar or Equal	1839415C1	Sensor	each	\$ 95.80	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
390	Navistar or Equal	1839416C91	Sensor	each	\$ 46.73	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
391	Navistar or Equal	1875838C91	Sensor	each	\$ 17.76	MCBEE	Superior Turbo & Injection				
392		3126904.6	Sensor	each	NO BID						
393	International or Equal	1836539C91	Sensor, Air Manifold Temp	each	\$ 25.30	TS5875 ECHLIN	Kirk's Automotive				
394	International or Equal	1885812C91	Sensor, Cam Position	each	\$ 21.09	Dorman	Unity School Bus Parts				
395	International or Equal	2587324C1	Sensor, Coolant Level, Low	each	\$ 22.34	Navistar	Midwest Transit Equipment				
396	International or Equal	1675751C1	Sensor, Coolant Water, Temperature	each	\$ 10.08	Dorman	Unity School Bus Parts				

397	Cummins	2872277	Sensor, Crank & Cam	each	\$ 13.50	2872277 INTERSTATE		Kirk's Automotive			
398	Cummins	2871960	Sensor, Differential Pressure Sensor	each	\$ 73.53	Dorman		Unity School Bus Parts			
399	Cummins	4384138	Sensor, EGDP	each	\$ 113.80	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck			
400	International or Equal	3626432C1	Sensor, Exhaust Gas Differential	each	\$ 151.62	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
401	International or Equal	1875784C93	Sensor, Fuel Pressure ICP Injection Control	each	\$ 164.23	ALLIANT POWER		Superior Turbo & Injection			
402	International or Equal	1845536C91	Sensor, Injection Control	each	\$ 156.13	ALLIANT POWER		Superior Turbo & Injection			
403	International or Equal	1839416C91	Sensor, Intake Pressure	each	\$ 44.75	DORMAN		Superior Turbo & Injection			
404	Cummins	2897333	Sensor, Instake Pressure and Temperature	each	\$ 35.23	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck			
405	International or Equal	1875838C91	Sensor, Manifold Intake Air Temperature (IAT)	each	\$ 17.76	ALLIANT POWER		Superior Turbo & Injection			
406	Cummins		Sensor, Nitrogen oxide sensor	each	NO BID						
407	Cummins	2894939	Sensor, Nitrogen oxide sensor	each	\$ 274.76	Dorman		Unity School Bus Parts			
408	International or Equal	1830669C92	Sensor, Oil Pressure	each	\$ 156.84	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
409	International or Equal	1850351C1	Sensor, Oil Pressure	each	\$ 90.88	Dorman		Unity School Bus Parts			
410	Cummins	2872858	Sensor, Temperature	each	\$ 46.35	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck			
411	Cummins	2894876	Sensor, Temperature Sensor	each	\$ 19.25	60104571 DORMAN		Kirk's Automotive			
412	Cummins	2897333	Sensor, Temperature Sensor DPF	each	\$ 35.23	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck			
413	Navistar or Equal	2587142C91	Shock Absorber	each	\$ 42.58	NAVISTAR		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S			
414	International or Equal	3578858C2	Shocks	each	\$ 62.75	MONROE	MAE 654885	Hoekstra			
415	Monroe or Equal	85926	Shocks	each	\$ 37.55	76926 NAPA-MONROE		Kirk's Automotive			
416	International or Equal	3578858C1	Shocks	each	\$ 63.31	MONROE		Jackson Truck			
417	Monroe or Equal	74425	Shocks	each	\$ 50.91	MONROE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S			
418	Navistar or Equal	3578858C1	Shocks	each	\$ 63.31	MONROE		Jackson Truck			
419	Sur-Lok or Equal		Special Accessories, Belt Cutter with Changeable Blade	each	\$ 6.96	Sur-Lok		Midwest Transit Equipment			
420	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, CAM Wrap, Seat Mount	each	\$ 47.60	EZ-On		Midwest Transit Equipment			
421	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, CAM Wrap, Tether Mount	each	\$ 43.40	EZ-On		Midwest Transit Equipment			
422	All Brands are Acceptable		Special Accessories, Fire Blanket	each	\$ 30.45			A Parts Warehouse			
423	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Adjustable L	each	\$ 68.64	EZ-ON		Unity School Bus Parts			
424	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Adjustable M	each	\$ 68.64	EZ-ON		Unity School Bus Parts			
425	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Adjustable S	each	\$ 68.64	EZ-ON		Unity School Bus Parts			
426	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Adjustable with Crotch Strap and CAM Wrap L	each	\$ 127.94	Besi		Midwest Transit Equipment			
427	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Adjustable with Crotch Strap and CAM Wrap M	each	\$ 117.26	EZ-ON		Unity School Bus Parts			

428	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Adjustable with Crotch Strap and CAM Wrap S	each	\$ 117.26	EZ-ON		Unity School Bus Parts				
429	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Adjustable XL	each	\$ 115.66	Besi		Midwest Transit Equipment				
430	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Adjustable XS	each	\$ 67.20	EZ-On		Midwest Transit Equipment				
431	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Adjustable XXS	each	NO BID							
432	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Non-Adjustable L	each	\$ 67.20	EZ-On		Midwest Transit Equipment				
433	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Non-Adjustable M	each	\$ 67.20	EZ-On		Midwest Transit Equipment				
434	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Non-Adjustable XL	each	\$ 102.20	EZ-On		Midwest Transit Equipment				
435	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Non-Adjustable XS	each	\$ 67.20	EZ-On		Midwest Transit Equipment				
436	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Non-Adjustable XXS	each	\$ 67.20	EZ-On		Midwest Transit Equipment				
437	Safeguard or Equal		Special Accessories, Star Plus Restraint Seat	each	\$ 166.38	Star		Midwest Transit Equipment				
438	Safeguard or Equal		Special Accessories, Star Restraint Seat	each	\$ 132.25	Star		Midwest Transit Equipment				
439	Q-Straint or Equal		Special Accessories, Tie Downs Retractable With S Hook - Floor Mount	each	\$ 494.62	Q-Straint		Midwest Transit Equipment				
440	Sure-Lok or Equal		Special Accessories, Tie Downs Retractable With S Hook - Floor Mount	each	NO BID							
441	Q-Straint or Equal		Special Accessories, Tie Downs Retractable With S Hook - Series A	each	\$ 303.17	Sur-Lok		Midwest Transit Equipment				
442	Sur-Lok or Equal		Special Accessories, Tie Downs Retractable With S Hook - Series A	each	\$ 318.32	Sure-Lok		Unity School Bus Parts				
443	Q-Straint or Equal		Special Accessories, Tie Downs Retractable With S Hook - Series L	each	\$ 301.36	Sur-Lok		Midwest Transit Equipment				
444	Sur-Lok or Equal		Special Accessories, Tie Downs Retractable With S Hook - Series L	each	\$ 307.82	Sure-Lok		Unity School Bus Parts				
445	Q-Straint or Equal		Special Accessories, Wheelchair Quick Straps/Webbing Loops 12"	each	\$ 9.72	Sure-Lok		Unity School Bus Parts				
446	Q-Straint or Equal		Special Accessories, Wheelchair Quick Straps/Webbing Loops 16"	each	\$ 9.80	Sur-Lok		Midwest Transit Equipment				

447	EZ-On or Equal		Special Accessories, Safety Vest Non-Adjustable S	each	\$ 120.30	Besi		Midwest Transit Equipment				
448		881A51190	Spring, Conti Air Spring 73745	each	\$ 107.30	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
449	Eaton or Equal	55-1133	Spring, Rear	each	\$ 169.83	DAYTON		Jackson Truck				
450	International or Equal	1684471C91	Spring, Rear	each	\$ 169.83	DAYTON		Jackson Truck				
451	Denso or Equal	228000-3311	Starter	each	\$ 255.00	228000-3311 DENSO		Kirk's Automotive				
452	Leece Neville or Equal	M105602	Starter	each	\$ 179.90	LEECE NEVILLE		Jackson Truck				
453	Leece Neville or Equal	M105602	Starter, DT466E Max Force	each	\$ 179.90	LEECE NEVILLE		Jackson Truck				
454	Navistar or Equal	2012316C1	Strap	each	\$ 141.89	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
455	Firestone or Equal	9219	Suspension, Air Bag	each	\$ 97.63	FIRESTONE		Jackson Truck				
456	Firestone or Equal	9648	Suspension, Air Bag	each	\$ 99.44	FLEETRITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
457	Goodyear or Equal	GY1R12401	Suspension, Air Bag	each	\$ 134.41	NAVISTAR		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
458	Goodyear or Equal	GY1R12538	Suspension, Air Bag	each	\$ 99.44	FLEETRITE		TriCounty International Trucks dba C and S				
459	Navistar or Equal	2207600C1	Switch	each	\$ 176.46	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
460	Braun Lift or Equal	32519KS	Switch	each	\$ 38.33	32519KS		Midwest Transit Equipment				
461	Navistar or Equal	3587009C92	Switch	each	\$ 130.30	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
462	International or Equal	1830669C92	Switch, Temperature	each	\$ 163.23	Dorman		Unity School Bus Parts				
463	Navistar or Equal	2014748C93	Tank	each	\$ 1,093.33	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
464		FD1060	Tensioner, Ford F800-FT900 Tensioner	each	NO BID							
465	International or Equal	1842130C1	Thermostat	each	\$ 58.33	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
466	Navistar or Equal	1831197C91	Thermostat	each	\$ 87.31	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
467	Navistar or Equal	1807329C92	Transmitter, ICP Sensor	each	\$ 111.37	Dorman		Unity School Bus Parts				
468	Navistar or Equal	3810607C2	Tube	each	\$ 59.05	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
469	Navistar or Equal	3810608C2	Tube, Return	each	\$ 62.39	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment				
470	Ford		Turbo, 6.0 Turbo - IHC		NO BID							
471	Weldon or Equal	1000	Turn Signal	each	\$ 10.68	Weldon		Midwest Transit Equipment				
472	Weldon or Equal	2010	Turn Signal	each	\$ 12.61	Weldon		Midwest Transit Equipment				
473	Peterson or Equal	M122A	Turn Signal, Side	each	\$ 4.55			A Parts Warehouse				
474	Peterson or Equal	PM-344A	Turn Signal, Side	each	\$ 28.25			A Parts Warehouse				
475	All Brands are Acceptable		U-Bolt Heavy Duty 3"	each	\$ 2.50			A Parts Warehouse				
476	All Brands are Acceptable		U-Bolt Heavy Duty 3.5"	each	\$ 2.50			A Parts Warehouse				
477	All Brands are Acceptable		U-Bolt Heavy Duty 4"	each	\$ 2.85			A Parts Warehouse				
478	Cummins	2881693	Valve, EGR	each	\$ 632.73	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck	\$ 632.73	Cummins		Midwest Transit Equipment
479	Cummins	4309416	Valve, EGR	each	\$ 651.48	CUMMINS		Jackson Truck	\$ 651.49	Cummins		Midwest Transit Equipment
480	Navistar or Equal	1846296C91	Valve, Exhaust Gas Recirculation	each	\$ 292.68	ALLIANT POWER		Superior Turbo & Injection				
481	International Navistar or Equal	1878918C2	Valve, Exhaust Gas Recirculation Assembly	each	\$ 444.61	DORMAN		Superior Turbo & Injection				
482	Cummins	2888173	Valve, Injector Doser Valve	each	\$ 134.00	0444043033 BOSCH		Kirk's Automotive				
483	All Brands are Acceptable		Washer Reservoir Pump	each	NO BID							

484	3M	49429	Weather Strip, Super Adhesive Black	each	NO BID						
485	All Brands are Acceptable		Windshield Washer Fluid - 55 gallon Drum	drum	\$ 79.95	SHELL		Jackson Truck			
486	All Brands are Acceptable		Windshield Washer Fluid - Rain Deicer Type - Gallon	gallon	\$ 2.25	MINUS20 NAPA		Kirk's Automotive			
487	All Brands are Acceptable	31-18	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 2.44	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
488	All Brands are Acceptable	31-19	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 2.44	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
489	All Brands are Acceptable	31-20	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 2.58	ANCO		Jackson Truck			
490	All Brands are Acceptable	31-22	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 2.44	Navistar		Midwest Transit Equipment			
491	All Brands are Acceptable	31-24	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 2.58	ANCO		Jackson Truck			
492	All Brands are Acceptable	51-16	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 1.50	Trico		A Parts Warehouse			
493	All Brands are Acceptable	51-18	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 1.80	Trico		A Parts Warehouse			
494	All Brands are Acceptable	59-18	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 3.00	Trico		A Parts Warehouse			
495	All Brands are Acceptable	60-2040	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 10.35	602040 NAPA		Kirk's Automotive			
496	All Brands are Acceptable	60-2440	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 13.55	602440 NAPA		Kirk's Automotive			
497	All Brands are Acceptable	91-18	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 1.80	Trico		A Parts Warehouse			
498	All Brands are Acceptable	91-20	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 3.95	NP20 NAPA		Kirk's Automotive			
499	All Brands are Acceptable	91-21	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 3.95	NP21 NAPA		Kirk's Automotive			
500	All Brands are Acceptable	91-22	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 2.60	Trico		A Parts Warehouse			
501	All Brands are Acceptable	91-24	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 2.60	Trico		A Parts Warehouse			
502	All Brands are Acceptable	B19H	Wiper Blade	each	NO BID						
503	All Brands are Acceptable	B20H	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 6.69	Autotex		Unity School Bus Parts			
504	All Brands are Acceptable	B22H	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 8.52	Autotex		Unity School Bus Parts			
505	All Brands are Acceptable	B24H	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 12.14	Autotex		Unity School Bus Parts			
506	All Brands are Acceptable	B28H	Wiper Blade	each	\$ 12.90	Autotex		Unity School Bus Parts			
507	Sound Off or Equal	ECVDASTSN	Rear Driver Alert Sign; Temp: -45° C and +65° C, Surface Mount, Certification: Tested to SAE J845/575 standards, Water resistant design exceeds SAE J845/575; shall be 23.5 by 8.75 by 1.5 inches in size. Must meet Michigan House Bill 4054, est. 12-21-2017.	each	\$ 248.75	Sound Off		Midwest Transit Equipment			