



**IFB #25.0005 COPY and SPECIALTY PAPER  
Summary**

All prices shall be held firm through 3/31/2025

Vendor: \_\_\_\_\_

Note: Column M must reflect the UoM (unit of measure) in column L												Milcraft				Paper Express				Veritiv Corporation			
ITEM #	MILL	BRAND	ITEM DESCRIPTION	SIZE	BASIS WEIGHT	PAPER GRADE	COLOR	MIN BRIGHTNESS	MIN OPACITY	QTY/CTN	UOM	PRICE PER UOM	MILL UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	BRAND UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	Vendor Notes	PRICE PER UOM	MILL UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	BRAND UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	Vendor Notes	PRICE PER UOM	MILL UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	BRAND UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	Vendor Notes
Item #1	Any	Any	Copy/Laser	8.5"x11"	20	Bond	White	90	90	5,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 41.10	Domtar	Buy & Give	AE3984	\$33.35	Norpac	Natural Choice		\$ 37.95	Veritiv	Econosource	
Item #2	Any	Any	Copy/Laser	8.5"x11"	20	Bond	White	90	90	5,000/CTN 40 CTN/PLT	Pallet	\$ 1,332.00	Suzano	Xerographic Report	AD3633	\$1,334.00	Norpac	Natural Choice		\$ 1,420.00	Veritiv	Econosource	
Item #3	Any	Any	Copy/Laser	8.5"x11"	20	Bond	White	90	90	5,000/CTN 40 CTN/PLT 21 pallets	Truckload	\$ 27,300.00	Norpac	Natural Choice	AJ8931 (have to order from supplier)	\$23,578.88	Norpac	Natural Choice		\$ 26,085.00	Veritiv	Econosource	Dock delivery only
Item #4	Any	Any	Recycled Copv/Laser	8.5"x11"	20	Bond	White	90	90	5,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 48.85	Sylvamo	Hammermill Tidal	ZO76	\$33.35	Norpac	Natural Choice		No Bid			
Item #5	Any	Any	3 Hole Copv/Laser	8.5"x11"	20	Bond	White	90	90	5,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 46.15	Domtar	Buy & Give	AE4179	\$45.80	Performance	Leading Edge		\$ 45.50	Veritiv	Econosource	
Item #6	Any	Any	Copy/Laser	8.5"x14"	20	Bond	White	90	90	5,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 58.55	Domtar	Buy & Give	AE4178	\$59.70	Performance	Leading Edge		\$ 58.00	Veritiv	Econosource	
Item #7	Any	Any	Copy/Laser	11"x17"	20	Bond	White	90	90	2,500/CTN	Carton	\$ 45.32	Domtar	Buy & Give	AE4180	\$47.00	Performance	Leading Edge		\$ 45.50	Veritiv	Econosource	
Item #8	Any	Any	Copy/Laser	11"x17"	20	Bond	White	90	90	2,500/CTN 40CTN/PLT	Pallet	\$ 1,410.00	Suzano	Xerographic Report	AD3636	\$1,880.00	Performance	Leading Edge		\$ 1,696.00	Veritiv	Econosource	
Item #9	Any	Any	Copy/Laser	8.5"x11"	20	Bond	Colors	90	90	5,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 66.25	Domtar	Lettermark	x	\$65.47	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 63.75	Sylvamo	Hammermill	
Item #10	Any	Any	Copy/Laser	8.5"x14"	20	Bond	Colors	90	90	5,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 90.60	Domtar	Lettermark	x	\$89.65	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 91.00	Sylvamo	Hammermill	
Item #11	Any	Any	Copy/Laser	11"x17"	20	Bond	Colors	90	90	2,500/CTN	Carton	\$ 76.50			x	\$70.41	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 72.00	Sylvamo	Hammermill	
Item #12	Any	Any	Uncoated Text	8.5"x11"	60	Book	White			5,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 63.50	Domtar	Husky	AB1958	\$65.29	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 62.00	Sylvamo	Williamsburg	
Item #13	Any	Any	Uncoated Text	11"x17"	60	Book	White			2,500/CTN	Carton	\$ 68.43	Domtar	Husky	AB1961	\$71.12	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 66.80	Sylvamo	Williamsburg	
Item #14	Any	Any	Uncoated Text	8.5"x11"	70	Book	White			4,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 57.76	Domtar	Husky	AB1962	\$60.94	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 58.00	Sylvamo	Williamsburg	
Item #15	Any	Any	Uncoated Text	11"x17"	70	Book	White			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 68.46	Domtar	Husky	AB1963	\$67.29	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 62.40	Sylvamo	Williamsburg	
Item #16	Any	Any	Index	8.5"x11"	110	Index	White			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 69.42	Domtar	Lettermark	AK6174	\$68.61	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 68.00	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #17	Any	Any	Index	11"x17"	110	Index	White			1,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 73.40	Domtar	Lettermark	AK6178	\$72.67	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 72.00	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #18	Any	Any	Index	8.5"x11"	110	Index	Colors			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$72.06	Domtar	Lettermark	x	\$71.22	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 72.00	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #19	Any	Any	Index	11"x17"	110	Index	Colors			1,000/CTN	Carton	x	x	x	x	No Bid				\$ 78.00	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #20	Any	Any	Vellum Bristol	8.5"x11"	67	VB	White			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 52.30	Domtar	Lettermark	AK6131	\$51.47	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 52.30	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #21	Any	Any	Vellum Bristol	11"x17"	67	VB	White			1,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 54.71	Domtar	Lettermark	AK6140	\$54.07	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 55.40	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #22	Any	Any	Vellum Bristol	8.5"x 11"	67	VB	Colors			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 53.72	Domtar	Lettermark	x	\$51.65	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 52.00	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #23	Any	Any	Vellum Bristol	11"x17"	67	VB	Colors			1,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 56.69	Domtar	Lettermark	x	\$56.00	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 56.00	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #24	Neenah	Astrobright	Smooth Text	8.5"x11"	60	Text	Colors			5,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 141.65	x	x	x	No Bid	x	x		No Bid	x	x	
Item #25	Neenah	Astrobright	Smooth Text	11"x17"	60	Text	Colors			2,500/CTN	Carton	\$ 141.80	x	x	x	No Bid	x	x		No Bid	x	x	
Item #26	Neenah	Astrobright	Smooth Cover	8.5"x11"	65	Cover	Colors			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 112.16	x	x	x	No Bid	x	x		No Bid	x	x	
Item #27	Neenah	Astrobright	Smooth Cover	11"x17"	65	Cover	Colors			1,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 112.21	x	x	x	No Bid	x	x		No Bid	x	x	
Item #28	Any	Any	Digital opaque colors	8.5"x11"	70	Text	Colors			4,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 67.92	Domtar	Lettermark	x	\$76.91	Domtar	Lettermark		No Bid			
Item #29	Any	Any	Digital opaque colors	11"x17"	70	Text	Colors			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 73.02	Domtar	Lettermark	x	\$82.10	Domtar	Lettermark		No Bid			
Item #30	Any	Any	Digital index	8.5"x11"	90	Index	White			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 57.88	Domtar	Lettermark	AK6161	\$57.20	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 56.50	Sylvamo	Springhill	



**IFB #25.0005 COPY and SPECIALTY PAPER  
Summary**

All prices shall be held firm through 3/31/2025

Vendor: \_\_\_\_\_

ITEM #	MILL	BRAND	ITEM DESCRIPTION	SIZE	BASIS WEIGHT	PAPER GRADE	COLOR	MIN BRIGHTNESS	MIN OPACITY	QTY/CTN	UOM	PRICE PER UOM	MILL UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	BRAND UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	Vendor Notes	PRICE PER UOM	MILL UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	BRAND UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	Vendor Notes	PRICE PER UOM	MILL UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	BRAND UNLESS BID SPECIFIED	Vendor Notes
Item #31	Any	Any	Digital index	11"x17"	90	Index	White			1,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 61.14	Domtar	Lettermark	AK6163	\$60.41	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 60.40	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #32	Any	Any	Digital index	8.5"x11"	90	Index	Colors			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 60.06	Domtar	Lettermark	x	\$59.34	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 74.00	Sylvamo	Springhill	2500/CTN
Item #33	Any	Any	Digital index	8.5"x11"	110	Index	White			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 69.42	Domtar	Lettermark	AK6174	\$68.61	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 68.00	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #34	Any	Any	Digital index	11"x17"	110	Index	White			1,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 73.40	Domtar	Lettermark	AK6178	\$72.67	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 72.00	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #35	Any	Any	Digital index	8.5"x11"	110	Index	Colors			2,000/CTN	Carton	\$ 72.06	Domtar	Lettermark	x	\$71.22	Domtar	Lettermark		\$ 72.00	Sylvamo	Springhill	
Item #36	IP	Any	Color copy digital	8.5"x11"	80	cover	white			2000/CTN	Carton	\$ 88.80	x	Hammermill	VO82	\$62.92	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 69.00	Sylvamo	Accent	
Item #37	IP	Any	Color copy digital	11"x17"	80	cover	white			1000/CTN	Carton	\$ 96.55	x	Hammermill	UO82	\$72.15	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 74.00	Sylvamo	Accent	
Item #38	IP	Any	Color copy digital	8.5"x11"	24	text	white			5000/CTN	Carton	\$ 108.05	x	Hammermill	DK89	\$69.55	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 70.00	Sylvamo	Accent	
Item #39	IP	Any	Color copy digital	8.5"x14"	24	text	white			5000/CTN	Carton	\$ 110.20	x	Hammermill	VH37	\$94.16	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 94.50	Sylvamo	Accent	
Item #40	IP	Any	Color copy digital	11"x17"	24	text	white			2500/CTN	Carton	\$ 91.63	x	Hammermill	WH37	\$71.12	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 75.00	Sylvamo	Accent	
Item #41	IP	Any	Color copy digital	8.5"x11"	32	text	white			4000/CTN	Carton	\$ 90.80	x	Hammermill	XH37	\$69.65	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 64.00	Sylvamo	Accent	3200/CTN
Item #42	IP	Any	Color copy digital	11"x17"	32	text	white			2000/CTN	Carton	\$ 92.40	x	Hammermill	AA1854	\$76.66	Domtar	Lynx		\$ 68.00	Sylvamo	Accent	1600/CTN
Item #43	Any	Any	Gloss photo paper	24"x100'	8 mil	gloss	white			1	Roll	\$ 80.58	Sihl	Maranello	AE9653	\$89.14				No Bid			
Item #44	Any	Any	Gloss photo paper	36"x100'	8 mil	gloss	white			1	Roll	\$ 120.94	Sihl	Maranello	AE8936	\$129.40				No Bid			
Item #45	Any	Any	Gloss photo paper	42"x100'	8 mil	gloss	white			1	Roll	\$ 136.98	Sihl	Maranello	AE6884	\$160.37				No Bid			
Item #46	Any	Any	Uncoated text	24"x500'	20	bond	white			1	Roll	\$ 28.28	x	Engineering	AJ7083 - 2RL/CT	\$21.01				No Bid			
Item #47	Any	Any	Uncoated text	30"x500'	20	bond	white			1	Roll	\$ 33.58	x	Engineering	AJ7077 - 2RL/CT	\$25.06				No Bid			
Item #48	Any	Any	Uncoated text	36"x500'	20	bond	white			1	Roll	\$ 40.69	x	Engineering	AJ7081 - 2RL/CT	\$28.79				No Bid			